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1. PURPOSE	
District	 staff	 show	 extraordinary	 dedication	 and	 care	 in	 their	 daily	 work	 with	
students.	 A	 hallmark	 of	 this	 commitment	 is	 the	 development	 of	 strong	
relationships	between	staff	and	students.	We	believe	that:	
	

● Children	are	always	learning	about	healthy	relationships,	and	their	most	
significant	learning	comes	from	how	adults	behave.	

● Consistent	relationship	boundaries	help	children	 feel	safe.	 	Boundaries	
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As	 such,	 volunteers	 are	 not	 subject	 to	 some	 of	 the	 provisions	 of	 this	 policy,	
however,	 the	 District	 still	 expects	 them	 to	 maintain	 appropriate	 conduct	 with	
students	when	they	are	engaged	in	District-authorized	activities.	
	

3. GUIDELINES	FOR	INTERACTIONS	BETWEEN	STAFF	AND	STUDENTS	
The	 interactions	 and	 relationships	 between	 staff	 and	 students	 should	be	based	
upon	mutual	respect	and	trust,	an	understanding	of	the	appropriate	boundaries	
between	 adults	 and	 students	 in	 and	 outside	 of	 the	 educational	 setting,	 and	
consistency	 with	 the	 educational	 mission	 of	 the	 schools.	 Staff	 are	 required	 to	
complete	annual	training	provided	by	the	District	on	sexual	conduct	prevention	to	
provide	guidance	and	establish	appropriate	professional	boundaries	for	student-
staff	interactions.	
	
Staff	will	not	intrude	on	a	student’s	physical	and	emotional	boundaries	unless	the	
intrusion	is	necessary	to	serve	an	educational	or	physical,	mental	and/or	emotional	
health	purpose.	An	educational	purpose	is	one	that	relates	to	the	staff’s	duties	in	
the	District.	Any	appearance	of	impropriety	should	be	avoided.	
	
Staff	 shall	 use	 good	 judgment	 in	 their	 relationships	with	 students	 beyond	 their	
work	responsibilities	and/or	outside	the	school	setting	and	shall	avoid	excessive	
informal	and	social	 involvements	with	 individual	students.	 In	addition	to	regular	
classroom	 instruction	and	extracurricular	 activities,	 appropriate	occasions	when	
staff	may	interact	with	students	beyond	the	school	day	include	before	and	after	
care,	 tutoring	 to	 improve	 students’	 academic	 skills,	 mentoring	 that	 provides	
students	 with	 positive	 role	 models,	 and	 hosting	 school-sanctioned	 or	 school-
sponsored	activities	and	events	that	reinforce	positive	behaviors.	
	
One-to-one	 tutoring	 and	 mentoring	 offered	 during	 school	 or	 non-school	 hours	
must	take	place	at	the	school	unless	the	principal	or	appropriate	supervisor	has	
received	 prior	 notification	 of	 an	 off-site	 location.	 When	 one-to-one	 tutoring	 or	
mentoring	 take	 place	 away	 from	 the	 school,	 written	 permission	 from	 the	
parent/guardian	must	be	obtained.	Volunteers	on	district	property	must	be	under	
the	supervision	of	a	district	staff	member.	
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● 	Respecting	student	privacy:	

Staff	 must	 honor	 a	 student’s	 physical	 and	 emotional	 boundaries	 unless	 the	
intrusion	 serves	 a	 legitimate	 educational	 purpose	 or	 is	 in	 response	 to	 an	
emergency.	For	example,	staff	members	should	not	invade	a	student’s	privacy	by	
entering	 a	 restroom	 when	 a	 student	 is	 present	 unless	 it	 falls	 within	 a	 staff	
member’s	regular	job	duties	under	an	established	written	protocol	or	to	use	it	for	
a	
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8. DUTY	TO	REPORT	POSSIBLE	VIOLATIONS	

Staff	shall	discuss	issues	with	their	building	administrator	or	supervisor	whenever	
they	suspect	or	are	unsure	whether	their	conduct,	or	the	conduct	of	other	staff,	is	
inappropriate	 or	 constitutes	 a	 violation	 of	 this	 policy.	 If	 the	 staff	 member	 is	
dissatisfied	with	the	response	of	the	building	administrator	or	supervisor,	he/she	
may	 bring	 it	 to	 the	 attention	 of	 the	 Chief	 of	 Human	 Resources.	 If	 the	 alleged	
behavior	deals	with	harassment,	intimidation,	or	bullying,	the	process	in	Policy	No-
----------.	should	be	followed.	The	district	will	investigate	anonymous	complaints	to	
the	best	of	its	ability.	
	
Additionally,	any	staff	member	who	has	reasonable	cause	to	believe	that	another	
staff	 member	 has	 engaged	 in	 sexual	 abuse	 with	 a	 student	 must	 fulfill	 the	
mandatory	reporting	requirements	to	the	Department	of	Human	Services.	
	
Employees	whose	conduct	violates	this	policy	or	who	fail	to	report	violations	of	this	
policy,	 may	 face	 discipline	 and/or	 termination,	 consistent	 with	 the	 district’s	
policies,	 acceptable	 use	 agreement	 and	 collective	 bargaining	 agreements,	 as	
applicable.	
	
Violations	of	this	policy	by	volunteers	or	contracted	service	providers	may	result	in	
a	prohibition	 from	working	or	 serving	 in	 school	 programs,	 trespass,	 or	 contract	
cancellation.	The	District	shall	notify	law	enforcement	of	any	potentially	unlawful	
conduct,	as	appropriate.	
	
Student/Parent	and	Guardian	Reporting	
	
Students	and/or	parents/guardians	are	strongly	encouraged	to	notify	the	principal	
or	other	appropriate	administrator	if	they	believe	a	staff	member	may	be	engaging	
in	conduct	that	violates	this	policy.			
	

9. CONFIDENTIALITY	AND	NON-RETALIATION	
Reporting	staff	members	are	specifically	advised	of	the	following:	

1. Reporting	 staff	 members	 are	 neither	 permitted	 nor	 responsible	 for	
investigating	whether	the	conduct	is	inappropriate;	
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2. Reporting	staff	members	are	required	to	maintain	confidentiality;	and	
3. Reporting	staff	members	must	directly	notify	a	supervisor,	not	a	peer,	

of	the	conduct.		
Confidentiality	 protects	 both	 the	 student(s)	 and	 the	 staff	 member	 who	 is	 the	
subject	 of	 the	 report.	 Failure	 to	 maintain	 confidentiality	 may	 impede	 the	
investigation	and	foster	untrue	and	potentially	harmful	rumors.	False	reports	are	
regarded	 as	 a	 serious	 offense	 and	 may	 result	 in	 disciplinary	 action	 or	 other	
appropriate	sanctions.	
	
The	District	prohibits	 retaliation	against	 anyone	who	makes	a	good-faith	 report	
under	this	policy.	Any	staff	who	retaliates	against	any	complainant,	 reporter,	or	
other	 participant	 in	 an	 investigation	 may	 be	 subject	 to	 discipline,	 up	 to	 and	
including	dismissal.		
	

10. 	TRAINING	
The	Superintendent	or	his/her	designee	shall	develop	an	annual	training	for	all	staff	
and	ensure	ongoing	review	of	procedures	to	support	this	policy.	
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